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Harrisburg, PA - Governor Tom Wolf today announced the investment of $97 million 
for 25 drinking water, wastewater, stormwater, and non-point source projects across 19 
counties through the Pennsylvania Infrastructure Investment Authority (PENNVEST) 
furthering his commitment to a lead-free Pennsylvania. 

“Historic investments in clean water infrastructure like the ones made today continue to 
underscore our commitment to safe and reliable infrastructure for our communities,” 
said Gov. Wolf. “Clean, lead-free drinking water and reliable wastewater and 
stormwater systems are the bedrock of vibrant civic centers and are essential to 
ushering in much-needed growth across the Commonwealth.” 

The funding for these projects originates from a combination of state funds approved 
by voters, Growing Greener, Marcellus Legacy funds, federal grants to PENNVEST from 
the Environmental Protection Agency, and recycled loan repayments from previous 
PENNVEST funding awards. Funds for these projects are disbursed after expenses for 
work are paid and receipts are submitted to PENNVEST for review. 

“While these projects will provide a solid foundation for children to attend schools and 
Pennsylvanians to work and play, they also address legacy environmental issues in our 
aging communities,” said Gov. Wolf. “I am determined to achieve our goal of 
eradicating lead from drinking water and many of these projects work toward that end.” 

In addition to continued improvements to drinking and wastewater facilities, PENNVEST 
utilized resources available under the U.S. Water Infrastructure Fund Transfer Act 
(WIFTA), signed into law in 2019, which allows for a transfer of funding to specifically 
address lead line replacements. 

A list of project summaries follows: 

Drinking Water Projects 
Allegheny County 

Coraopolis Water and Sewer Authority* – received a $1,117,000 grant to replace 
approximately 2,200 feet of leaded-joint distribution pipe and associated valves.  The 
project will eliminate potential health concerns by removing lead from distribution lines 
for 2,309 residential customers. 

 

 



Armstrong County 

Ford City Borough* – received a $1,679,524 grant to replace approximately 2,650 feet 
of water main with lead joints along 5th Avenue, between 14th and 17th Streets.  The 
project will eliminate the risk of user lead exposure and improve the water supply for an 
area that experiences frequent leakage throughout the current distribution system. 

Blair County 

Bellwood Borough Authority* – received a $1,569,904 grant to remove and replace 
approximately 4,000 feet of existing cast iron/lead water main along State Route 
865.  The project will result in improved reliability and a significant reduction in 
potential lead contamination in the community’s drinking water. 

Bradford County 

Towanda Municipal Authority* – received a $2,234,500 grant to remove and replace 
approximately 7,600 feet of existing lead-containing cast iron pipe and associated 
service connections.  The project will impact approximately 200 residential customers in 
Monroe Borough and will ensure safe, potable drinking water. 

Cambria County 

Hastings Municipal Authority* – received a $2,054,884 grant to replace approximately 
6,200 feet of cast iron water pipe with leaded joints and associated equipment along 
3rd Avenue and Spangler Street.  This project will remove lead from distribution lines in 
a system that serves 654 residential customers and address aging water lines prone to 
leaks, to create a more reliable water supply. 

Crawford County 

Linesville Borough* – received a $775,994 grant to replace approximately 2,300 feet of 
cast iron water lines containing lead joints, as well as service connections and 
associated equipment. The project will eliminate the risk of lead exposure and reduce 
water loss for area residents connected to an aging water distribution system. 

Erie County 

Erie City Water Authority* – received a $6,500,000 grant to replace approximately 
1,300 existing wrought iron service connections attached to water mains by lead 
goosenecks.  The project will address aged, leaking infrastructure to prevent future 
water loss and potential risk of lead exposure to users served in the area. 

 



Fulton County 

McConnellsburg Borough Municipal Authority – received a $996,000 loan to install 
approximately 400 feet of contact piping between a water treatment plant and storage 
tank to create the required contact time and allow the tank to be used for finished 
water storage.  The project will bring the system into compliance and improve water 
quality by reducing the threat of Giardia and addressing concerns outlined by a 
Pennsylvania Department of Environmental Protection Consent Order. 

McKean County 

Bradford City Water Authority* – received a grant of $8,520,000 to replace 
approximately 16,800 feet of lead-jointed water mains and 573 lead service line 
connections within the City of Bradford.  The project will reduce leaks from aged 
infrastructure and eliminate the risk of lead exposure to users in the service area. 

Warren County 

Southwest Warren County Municipal Authority* – received a $741,416 loan and a 
$301,584 grant to install a 40,600-gallon concrete tank and 188 feet of piping for 
adequate chlorine contact time, as well as replace 1,250 feet of water distribution pipe 
containing lead components.  The project will eliminate potential health threats of 
Giardia and lead exposure in the public water system by ensuring the system meets 
treatment technique and disinfection monitoring requirements. 

Westmoreland County 

Ligonier Township Municipal Authority* – received a $5,525,000 loan to install a 
250,000-gallon water tank and five pressure boosting stations and replace 
approximately 21,000 feet of water line and an access bridge to a water treatment 
plant.  The project will significantly reduce water loss due to leakage and improve water 
pressure to customer taps. 

Wastewater Projects 
Allegheny County 

Pittsburgh Water and Sewer Authority** – received a $23,970,000 loan to line or repair 
approximately 22 miles of sewer collection line in the Homewood, Squirrel Hill, Marshall-
Shadeland, Spring Garden, Highland Park, and Maytide areas.  The project will aid in 
the elimination of sewage overflows and reduce infiltration into the collection lines. 

Lackawanna County 

Lackawanna River Basin Sewer Authority** – received a $2,326,900 loan to eliminate a 
combined sewer overflow point and construct 6,500 feet of gravity interceptor sewer in 



Vandling Borough, Lackawanna County and Clinton Township, Wayne County.  The 
project will reduce pollution in a high-quality, cold-water fishery and eliminate exposure 
to untreated sewage by improved conveyance and re-direction of all flows. 

Mercer County 

Perry Township – received a $37,997 loan and a $1,168,103 grant to install 4,800 feet 
of low-pressure sewer mains, a duplex grinder pump station and equipment, and a 
Community Onlot Disposal System.  The project will resolve compliance issues with the 
current malfunctioning onlot systems, which have a confirmed 87 percent failure rate, 
and will eliminate untreated sewage discharges through the use of a low-pressure 
sewer collection system. 

Stormwater Projects 
Allegheny County 

Municipality of Bethel Park – received a $1,052,679 loan to construct a 900-foot swale 
to intercept surface runoff and install 1,250 feet of storm sewer pipe.  The project will 
reduce flooding occurrences in residential areas and improve water quality of receiving 
streams by removing sediment. 

Non-point Source Water Quality Improvement Projects 
Luzerne County 

Wyoming Valley Sanitary Authority** – received a $2,795,652 loan to restore 600 feet 
of streambank, while adding a quarter-acre rain garden and retrofitting existing 
stormwater basins.  The project will eliminate 193,024 pounds of sediment, 3,809 
pounds of nitrogen, and 401 pounds of phosphorus annually. 

* denotes projects that have Drinking Water State Revolving Funds 

** denotes projects that are funded with Clean Water State Revolving Funds 

Note: Article modified to showcase PMAA members only. 


